BID SUMMARY

BID NUMBER: 51478

State of Connecticut

Dept. of Energy & Environmental Protection
79 Elm Street, Hartford, CT 06106
(860) 424-3825

Ifaward is made to other than low

To: bidder, please explain here.
Phone: Fax:
BIDDER #1 BIDDER #2 BIDDER #3 BIDDER #4
ITEM # | North Fork Helicopter’s Clarke Environmental NO BID NO BID
(A) (1) 2020 - $2.50 (1) 2020 - $1.04
(2) 2021 - $2.60 (2) 2021 - $1.06
(3) 2022 - $2.75 (3) 2022 - $1.08
(4) 2023 - $2.80 (4) 2023 - $1.10
(5) 2024 - $2.80 (5) 2024 - $1.12
(B) (1) 2020 - $22.00 NO BID
(2) 2021 - $22.66 NO BID
(3) 2022 - $23.33 NO BID
(4) 2023 - $23.33 NO BID
(5) 2024 - $24.03 NO BID
TOTAL NO BID NO BID
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